

03/06/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: P. Feaman's 2/23/17 letter to Ken Pollock re: Estate's claim in Illinois action and Tescher and Spallina should have known before the Estate's interest in same	0.10	A/PP/D
03/06/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Rock Legal's 2/23/17 invoice re: 2/10/17 courier run to Judge Scher re: hearing notebook for 2/16/17 Case Management Conference; arrange for payment	0.10	A/PP/D
03/06/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: E. Bernstein's Exhibit 18 - 2/15/17 letter from Ronik S. Seecharan, D.M.D., P.A. re: in support of his request to continue the 3/2/17 Case Management Conference	0.10	A/PP/D
03/07/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Subpoena for (3/16/17) Hearing to Ted Bernstein, filed 3/7/17 by Peter Feaman.	0.10	
03/07/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/7/17 Supreme Court of Florida Ruling that Respondent's "Motion to Dismiss Appeal and for Impositions of Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant" is denied as moot, Case SC17-361.	0.10	
03/07/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Appellee's, Ted Bernstein, as Trustee, Response to Latest Motion for Extension, and Request that Court Dismiss Appeal and Impose Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant, filed 3/7/17 in 4th DCA by Alan Rose.	0.20	
03/07/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 3/7/17 2:47 pm email to counsel re: deposition of BMO before 3/16/17.	0.10	
03/07/17	CAA	Review file re: P. Feaman's request to depose B. O'Connell on 3/13/17; review file re: 3/3/17 Order Setting 3/16/17 Hearing from 2:00 to 4:00 and Establishing Procedure	0.60	A/PP/D

03/07/17	CAA	Review file re: E. Bernstein's (Appellant) 3/6/17 Motion for Additional Reasonable Extension-Stay-Continuance Based on Newly Discovered Evidence and New Hearings in the Lower Tribunal (4D16-3314)	0.20	A/PP/D
03/07/17	CAA	Review file re: J. Foglietta's email to B. O'Connell re: [REDACTED]	0.10	A/PP/D
03/07/17	JAF	Prepared for deposition of BMO.	0.20	
03/08/17	CAA	Review file re: Estate's 3/6/17 Motion to Dismiss Appeal and for Imposition of Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant, and Supreme Court's 3/6/17 Order dismissing appeal for lack of jurisdiction re Supreme Court Appeal, SC17-361	0.30	A/PP/D
03/08/17	CAA	Review file re: Rock Legal's 2/10/17 invoice for courier run to Judge Scher re: hearing notebook for 2/16/17 Case Management Conference; arrange for payment	0.10	A/PP/D
03/08/17	ANG	Conference with JAF re: [REDACTED]	0.20	
03/08/17	JAF	Conference with ANC re [REDACTED]	0.20	D
03/09/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Trustee's Written Closing Argument filed 3/9/17 by Alan Rose.	0.20	
03/09/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 3/9/17 9:16 pm email memo.	0.10	PR
03/09/17	CAA	Coordinate mailing of payment to Rock Legal re: courier service to Judge Scher on 2/10/17	0.10	A/PP
03/09/17	CAA	Review file re: P. Feaman's 3/7/17 Subpoena for Hearing to Ted Bernstein, c/o A. Rose re: 3/16/17 hearing	0.10	A/PP/D
03/09/17	CAA	Review file re: Ted Bernstein's 3/7/17 Response to Appellant's (E. Bernstein's) Latest Motion for Extension, and Request that Court Dismiss Appeal and Impose Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant re: 4D16-3314	0.10	A/PP/D

03/09/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re:, Supreme Court's 3/7/17 Order denying Respondent's Motion to Dismiss Appeal and for Impositions of Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant, as moot re: SC17-361	0.10	A PP D
03/09/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Eliot's multiple filings on 3/8/17 re: 3rd Corrected and Refiled Submission of List of Exhibits, etc. (947 pages - Parts 1 - 3 combined) + (56 pages) + (33 Pages) + (50 pages) + (46 pages) + (50 pages) + (1 page) + (41 pages) + (3 pages) + (51 pages) + (47 pages) + (429 pages) + (16 + 140 pages) + (358 pages) + (12 + 367 pages) + (39 + 262 pages) + (67 + 269 pages) + (27 pages) + (289 pages) + (5 + 348 + 8 pages) + (13 + 89 pages) + (229 pages) (3 + 96 pages) + (28 pages)	1.20	A PP D
03/09/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: A. Rose's 3/9/17 email and letter to Judge Scher, and Closing Argument re: hearing held on 3/2/17	0.10	A PP D
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Eliot Bernstein as Beneficiary and Interested Person with Standing Closing Arguments on Initial Hearings filed 3/10/17 by Eliot Bernstein.	0.30	
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Taking Depo Duces Tecum of Brian O'Connell, PR, on 3/13/17, filed 3/10/17 by Peter Feaman.	0.10	
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Filing Verified Return of Service (Ted Bernstein), filed 3/10/17 by Peter Feaman.	0.10	
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Motion to Accept Less Than One Day Late Filing and Briefly Exceed Page Limits, etc., filed 3/10/17 by Eliot Bernstein.	0.10	
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 3/10/17 4:26 pm email memo re: [REDACTED]	0.10	PR
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 3/15/17 4:32 pm email memo.	0.10	PR

03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 3/10/17 4:42 pm email memo.	0.10	PR
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 3/10/17 6:42 pm email memo.	0.10	PR
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of HLG 3/10/17 8:35 pm email memo.	0.10	PR
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 3/10/17 9:02 pm email memo.	0.10	PR
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 3/10/17 9:03 pm email memo.	0.10	PR
03/10/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 3/10/17 9:06 pm email to Alan Rose re: hearing transcripts 2/16/17 and 3/2/17.	0.10	PR
03/10/17	CAA	Discussions with J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; review file; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]	0.10	D
03/10/17	CAA	Prepare and send email to B. O'Connell and A. Crispin re: [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Mudrick Court Reporting re: ordering same; multiple email communications with Linda at Mudrick re: same; email communications with J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; prepare and send email to A. Rose re: requesting copies of transcripts.	0.50	D PP A
03/10/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: P. Feaman's 3/9/17 letter to Judge Scher re: Stansbury's Closing Argument in support of his Motion to Disqualify A. Rose and Mrachek, Fitzgerald, and Motion to Vacate in Part the Court's Ruling on 9/1/16; email communications with H. Graboyes re: filed-stamped copy of Stansbury's Closing Argument filed on 3/9/17; review file re: Stansbury's Notice of Filing 2/16/17 Hearing Transcript	0.40	D PP A
03/10/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Stansbury's 3/10/17 Notice of Taking Deposition Duces Tecum of B. O'Connell on 3/13/17; discussions with J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]	0.30	D PP A

03/10/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Stansbury's 3/10/17 Notice of Filing Verified Return of Service of Subpoena for Hearing (3/2/17) on Ted Bernstein	0.10	D PP A
03/10/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: E. Bernstein's as Beneficiary and Interested Person With Standing Closing ARguments on Initial Hearings (re 2/16/17 and 3/2/17); prepare and send email to B. O'Connell and J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; review Eliot's Motion to Accept Less than One Day Late Filing re Closing Argument	0.20	D PP A
03/10/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Subpoena for Deposition Duces Tecum served on B. O'Connell on 3/10/17 re: 3/13/17 deposition	0.20	D PP A
03/10/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: E. Bernstein's 3/10/17 Supplemental Exhibit #77 (3/2/17 hearing transcript) Added to 3rd Corrected and Refiled Subkission of List of Exhibits, etc.	0.10	D PP A
03/10/17	JAF	Memo re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] prepared instruction memo to CCC re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.0); Revisions to motion for protective order draft (.3); Preparation for BMO deposition (.2); Conference with CCC re [REDACTED] (.2).	1.70	
03/10/17	CCC	Drafted Motion for Protective Order (1.3) ; Review of [REDACTED] (.2); Revised and filed Motion for Protective Order (.3); Conference with JAF re: [REDACTED] (.2)	2.00	D 1.8
03/12/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/12/17 10:12 am email from Alan Rose re: Hearing transcripts re: 2/16/17 and 3/2/17.	0.10	
03/13/17	BMO	Conference with ANC re: [REDACTED]	0.30	PR

03/13/17	BMO	Telephone call to Peter Feaman re: settlement.	0.20
03/13/17	BMO	Attend deposition - Stansbury's DT Deposition of BMO.	2.40
03/13/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Filing Verified Return of Service (Brian O'Connell), filed 3/13/17 by Peter Feaman.	0.10
03/13/17	BMO	Preparation with ANC re: [REDACTED]	0.60 PR
03/13/17	BMO	Conference with JAF re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.50 PR
03/13/17	ANG	Preparation with BMO re: [REDACTED]	0.60
03/13/17	ANG	Conference with BMO re: [REDACTED]	0.30
03/13/17	ANG	Attend (in part) Stansbury's Depo Duces Tecum of Brian O'Connell.	2.00
03/13/17	JAF	Conference with BMO re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.5); Preparation for same and issues relating to Illinois lawsuit (.9); Prepared memo to BMO on [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.2); Consideration of Illinois settlement offer (.3); Conference with John C. re payoff of first mortgage (.1); Memo re: same (.2).	2.20
03/14/17	BMO	Receipt and review of email from Alan Rose re: 3-14-17 email from Eliot.	0.10
03/14/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/14/17 12:29 pm email from Ted Bernstein.	0.10
03/14/17	CAA	Review 2/16/17 and 3/2/17 hearing transcripts, and profile same into system	0.50 PP AD
03/14/17	CAA	Review 3/9/17 Illinois settlement proposal from Adam Simon to J. Stamos re: Illinois federal action; profile same into system	0.20 PP AD
03/14/17	CAA	Review P. Feaman's 2/23/17 letter to Judge Scher re: 3/2/17 hearing	0.10 PP AD
03/14/17	CAA	Refiled Stansbury's 3/13/17 Notice of Filing Verified Return of Service on B. O'Connell re: Subpoena for Deposition Duces Tecum on 3/13/17	0.10 PP AD

03/14/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; prepare and send response email	0.10	A PP D
03/14/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] profile same into system	0.10	A PP D
03/15/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/15/17 4:57 pm email from Mudrick Reporting with attached correspondence re: 3/13/17 deposition.	0.10	
03/15/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 3/15/17 1:42 pm email memo.	0.10	PR
03/15/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] arrange for payment;	0.20	A PP D
03/15/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] scan and profile same into system	0.20	A PP D
03/15/17	ANG	Strategy conference with JAF re: [REDACTED]	0.40	
03/15/17	JAF	Additional preparation for hearing on Stansbury motion for discharge of responsibility of Illinois litigation (.4); <u>Strategy conference with ANC re [REDACTED] (.4)</u>	0.80	.4 D
03/16/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Additional Case Law Authority filed 3/16/17 by Peter Feaman with attached case law, Funchess v. Gulf Stream Apartments of Broward County and Campbell v. Owen.	0.20	
03/16/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Eliot Bernstein as Beneficiary & Interested Person with Standing Supplemental Exhibit on Discovery, etc., filed 3/16/17 by Eliot Bernstein.	0.20	
03/16/17	BMO	Receipt and review of email from Alan Rose re: Motion for Discharge.	0.10	
03/16/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 3/16/17 11:42 am email memo.	0.10	PR

03/16/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/16/17 6:35 pm email from Alan Rose.	0.10
03/16/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 3/16/17 email to counsel with attached Petition for Authorization to Pay Taxes for 2014 on the property located at 2753 NW 34th Street, Boca Raton.	0.10 <i>PR</i>
03/16/17	CAA	Receive and review W. Stansbury's Notice of Additional Case Law Authority for 3/16/17 continued hearing; profile same into system; conduct Westlaw search and print case law; update hearing folder; meet and discuss same with Z. Rothman	0.70 <i>PP AD</i>
03/16/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; profile instructions in system pending receipt of order on our Petition for Authorization to Pay Property Taxes from Estate	0.20 <i>PP AD</i>
03/16/17	CAA	Receive and arrange for mailing payment to White Lion Moving and Storage for April 2017	0.10 <i>PP A</i>
03/16/17	CAA	Receive instructions from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; email communications with J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; draft updated changes	0.20 <i>PP AD</i>
03/16/17	CAA	Receive instructions from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] telephone conference with Koffki Antiques re: same; prepare and send email to Melanie Hill, owner of Koffki Antiques re: Hall & Hall appraisal for her review and consideration; update Memo re: [REDACTED]	0.40
03/16/17	CAA	Review our Petition for Authorization to Pay 2014 Property Taxes from Estate re: 2753 N.W. 34th Street, Boca Raton, FL; discussions with J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; draft proposed Order granting Petition; e-file Notice of Hearing; prepare and send email to opposing counsel re: same and proposed Order	0.60 <i>PP A</i> .3

03/16/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: E. Bernstein's 3/16/17 Supplemental Exhibit on Discovery and Conflicts Relevant to Initial Hearings, etc., etc. re: 3/16/17 continued hearing on multiple matters	0.10	PP A D
03/16/17	JAF	Addressed issues re updated taxes due on Boca Raton real property (.2); Preparation for hearing on Stansbury discharge, reviewed Eliot filing supplemental exhibit and Feaman additional case law (.9); Instructions to CA re [REDACTED] (.1).	1.20	
03/16/17	JAF	Revisions to petition for authorization to pay taxes and review of mortgages and notes associated with Boca property; first and second mortgage and property values (1.1); Instructions to CCC re [REDACTED] (.1); Prepared email to counsel re same (.1).	1.30	
03/16/17	ZR	Conference with ANC and JAF re: [REDACTED] (.5); Prepare for same (1.0).	1.50	D 1.0
03/16/17	ZR	Attend special set evidentiary hearing on 1. trustee's motion to approve retention of counsel and appointed Ted Bernstein as AAL and 2. Motion for Discharge from Further Responsibility filed by Feaman; <u>Travel time</u> .	3.50	U UT 2.5
03/16/17	CCC	Drafted Petition for Authorization to Pay 2014 Property Taxes (.7); Researched property tax information on Tax Collector's Website (.2); Conference with JAF regarding [REDACTED] (.1); Further revised the Petition and filed same (.8); Prepared Notice of Hearing re: Same (.2)	2.00	D 1.9
03/17/17	BMO	Telephone call to Peter Feaman re: proposal.	0.30	
03/17/17	CAA	Draft Petition for fees and costs for period 12/1/16 through 1/31/17; review file to confirm we previously filed petition for fees and costs for period 7/1/16 through 8/12/16; discuss same with J. Foglietta	1.30	D 1.0

03/17/17	CAA	Receive and review invoice from White Lion Moving & Storage (WLSS/United Storage Solutions) for storage fee for April 2017	0.10	PP A
03/17/17	CAA	Receive and review email from Mudrick Court Reporting to B. O'Connell attaching letter re: information on reading and signing his deposition transcript; profile same	0.30	PP A
03/17/17	ZR	Conference with BMO re: [REDACTED]	0.20	D
03/20/17	BMO	Strategy conference with JAF re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.10	
03/20/17	CAA	Prepare hearing folder on Estate's Petition to Pay Property Taxes re: 2753 N.W. 34th Street set for 3/21/17; draft revisions to proposed Order on same; arrange for court reporter; receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; profile same into system	1.30	
03/20/17	CAA	Receive and review email instructions from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20	D
03/20/17	CAA	Receive and review email instructions from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; draft Re-Notice of Hearing; cancel court reporter and reset to 3/30/17; e-file Re-Notice of Hearing; prepare and send email to counsel of record re: same	0.50	D PP A

03/20/17	JAF	Reviewed LLLP Bernstein agreement and Bernstein Holdings agreement; updated memo to file; reviewed memo from CCC [REDACTED] (.4, plus .1 NO Charge); Instructions to CA re [REDACTED] (.1); Strategy conference with BMO re [REDACTED] 1.1).	1.60
03/20/17	JAF	Analysis of results of Eliot conflict waiver (.6); preparation for hearing on petition for authorization to pay taxes (.3); Reviewed BFR operatign agreement and memo from CCC re same (.2, plus .1 NO Charge); Reviewed memo from CCC re [REDACTED] (.1); Prepared memo to file re: [REDACTED] (.4).	1.60
03/20/17	CCC	Researched [REDACTED]; Memo to JAF re: (.6); Researched [REDACTED] Memo to JAF re (.3); Reviewed [REDACTED] and memo to JAF re: (1.6)	2.50
03/21/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/20/17 correspondence from Peter Feaman with copy of letter Feaman sent to Ken Pollock.	0.10
03/21/17	BMO	Receipt and review of email from Eliot Bernstein - reply to our email request re: hearing to pay interest on home.	0.10
03/21/17	BMO	Conference with JAF re: [REDACTED]	0.20 - PR
03/21/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Unavailability from 6/19/17 through 6/28/17, filed 3/21/17 by Feaman (502012CP004391).	0.10
03/21/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Unavailability from 6/19/17 through 6/28/17, filed 3/21/17 by Feaman (502102CA013933).	0.10 - D

03/21/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Plaintiff's Motion to Continue Trial, filed 3/21/17 by Feaman (502012CA013933).	0.10
03/21/17	CAA	Email communications with Julie in accounting and J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30 A PP
03/21/17	CAA	Receive and review email communications between J. Foglietta and John Cappeller re: 2014 property taxes re: Sahm mortgage	0.10 D
03/21/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: P. Feaman's 3/21/17 Notice of Unavailability filed in Stansbury v. Estate of Simon and Bernstein Family Realty action (502012CA13933), and E/O Simon action	0.10 A PP D
03/21/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Stansbury's 3/21/17 Motion to Continue Trial re: Stansbury v. Estate of Simon, et al action (2012CA13933)	0.10 A PP D
03/21/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: 3/20/17 letter4 from P. Feaman to B. O'Connell re: his 2/23/17 letter to Ken Pollack making demand to Tescher & Spallina's insurance company for reimbursement of Stansbury's fees	0.30 A PP D
03/21/17	JAF	Correspondence with Cappeller re payment of taxes on Boca Raton property (.1); Research re [REDACTED] (.3).	0.40
03/22/17	CAA	Receive and review multiple emails between Kevin Hall (on behalf of E. Bernstein) and A. Rose	0.30 D
03/22/17	CAA	Prepare and send email to Julie in accounting re: prebill from 7/1/16 through 1/31/17; receive and review response email from Julie re: same; review file re: last date petition for CLO fees was filed; prepare and send response email to Julie; receive and review prebill; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: same	0.30 A PP

03/22/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: 2/13/17 invoice from Stamos & Trucco	0.10	A PP D
03/23/17	BMO	Strategy conference with JAF re: [REDACTED]	0.60	
03/23/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; review file and probate rules re: [REDACTED]; conduct online search of USPS re: tracking certified mailed Objectons by Estate; review court's docket sheet to confirm date E. Bernstein filed his Complaint; prepare and send response email to J. Foglietta	1.10	A PP D
03/23/17	JAF	Strategy conference with BMO re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.6); Analyzed settlement offer from Illinois litigation and settlement agreement with T&S (.3).	0.90	
03/24/17	BMO	Conference with Stamos and JAF re: settlement offer (.1); Strategy conference with JAF re: [REDACTED] (.2).	0.30	
03/24/17	BMO	Receipt and review of HLG 3/24/17 10:28 am email memo.	0.10	PR
03/24/17	BMO	Telephone call to Peter Feaman re: settlement.	0.20	
03/24/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] prepare and send response email	0.10	
03/24/17	JAF	Conference with Stamos and BMO re settlement offer (.1); Strategy conference with BMO re [REDACTED] (.2); Review of [REDACTED] (.2).	0.50	
03/27/17	BMO	Conference with JAF and Alan Rose re: Stansbury settlement and position of trustee on payment of taxes on Boca Raton home (1.0); Post-meeting strategy conference with JAF re: [REDACTED] (.3).	1.30	

03/27/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; review file; prepare and send response email; review file for February 2017 statement; prepare and send email to S. Lobedell re: same; telephone conference with JP Morgan Chase Bank re: same; prepare and send text to former paralegal C. Thomas re: password to view JP Morgan statements online; set-up user and password to view JP Morgan statements online	1.00	D PP A
03/27/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; review file re: same; review court's docket sheet; prepare and send response email; receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; review file; prepare and send response email	0.30	D PP A
03/27/17	CAA	Receive and review mailed copy of JP Morgan's February 2017 statement for account ending in 8004; profile same in system; prepare and send updated email to J. Foglietta re: balance of Estate's account	0.20	D PP A
03/27/17	JAF	Conference with BMO and Alan Rose re Stansbury settlement and position of trustee on payment of taxes on Boca Raton home (1.0); Post-meeting strategy conference with BMO re [REDACTED] (.3); Prepared memo to file on [REDACTED] (.3); Review of entity information on BFR (.1).	1.70	
03/27/17	CCC	Researche [REDACTED] (.2); Drafted memo to file regarding [REDACTED] (.1)	0.30	
03/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/28/17 4th DCA Order that Appellant's 3/6/17 M/Additional Reasonable Extension-Stay-Continuance granted in part (4D16-3314).	0.10	
03/29/17	CAA	Receive and review email from Mitch at Pleasanton & Marsaa Court Reporting re: 3/30/17 hearing; review file; prepare and send response email	0.10	PP A

03/29/17	JAF	Final review of hearing folder and analysis of additional materials needed in preparation for hearing on petition for authorization to pay taxes.	0.90
03/30/17	BMO	Conference with ANC re: [REDACTED]	0.20 <i>PR</i>
03/30/17	BMO	Receipt and review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10
03/30/17	CAA	Receive and review email from Mitch at Pleasanton & Marsaa Court Reporting re: Judge Scher not sitting in court today and that Judge Harrison is hearing her cases today; prepare and send response email; receive voicemail from Mitch re: same	0.10 <i>PP A</i>
03/30/17	CAA	Prepare and send email to Pleasanton Court Reporting and order transcript of 3/30/17 hearing on our Petition for Auth to Pay 2014 Property Taxes; draft and e-file 2nd Re-Notice of Hearing on same for 4/6/17; review Judge Scher's suspension calendar re: same; extended telephone conference with Tax Collector's office re: what to expect if taxes not paid by deadline, 3/31/17; review Tax Collector's website re: 2014 certificate holder of property; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: same	1.80 <i>PP A</i>
03/30/17	ANG	Conference with BMO re: [REDACTED]	0.20
03/30/17	JAF	Conference with BMO re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.3); Research re [REDACTED] (.3); Prepared instruction memo to CA re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.1).	0.70
03/30/17	JAF	Conference with John Cappeller re payment of taxes on Boca Raton property and potential foreclosure by Sahm (.2); Instruction memo to CA re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.1).	0.30
03/31/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 3/31/17 5:08 pm email re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10 <i>PR</i>
03/31/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 3/31/17 5:22 pm email from John Cappeller, Jr. re: Bernstein Estate and Sham Mortgage.	0.10

03/31/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review file; prepare and send multiple emails to J. Foglietta [REDACTED]; discussions with S. Lobdell re: same; review documents contained in safe for this matter re: same	0.90	A PP D
03/31/17	CAA	Receive voicemail from Kenya at Palm Beach County Tax Collector's office re: delinquent property taxes; return and leave voicemail message for Kenya re: same	0.10	A PP
03/31/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: 4th DCA's 3/28/17 Order granting E. Bernstein's 3/6/17 Motion for Additional Reasonable Extension-Stay-Continuance Based on Newly Discovered Evidence and New Hearings in the Lower Tribunal (giving him 15 days to file Initial Brief), and denying Appellee's 3/7/17 Motion to Dismiss and Impose Non-Monetary Sanctions re: 4D16-3314; calendar deadline for E. Bernstein to file initial brief	0.20	A PP D
03/31/17	JAF	Reviewed memo re [REDACTED]; instructions to CA re [REDACTED] (.1); Correspondence with Cappeller re payment of taxes (.1).	0.20	
03/31/17	JAF	Consideration of petition for instructions re 2nd mortgage and foreclosure and prepared memo to CCC re [REDACTED] (.4); Conference with BMO re [REDACTED] (.1).	0.50	
04/01/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/1/17 2:37 pm email from Peter Feaman.	0.10	
04/03/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 4/3/17 10:40 am email to John Cappeller, Jr. re: Bernstein Estate and Sham Mortgage.	0.10	PR
04/03/17	CAA	Telephone conference with Melanie Hill with Koffki Antiques re: status of her review of the Hall and Hall appraisal in order to receive her quote to buy the property in bulk;	0.20	
04/03/17	JAF	Consideration of rebuttal witness lists Stansbury action.	0.20	

04/03/17	CCC	Drafted Petition for Instruction re: note and second mortgage (1.1)	1.20
04/04/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/3/17 Order Denying Motion to Have Videotaped Recordings of All Proceedings Due to Proven and Admitted Fraud on the Court by Court Appointed Officers and Fiduciaries and More, on the Court's Own Motion and Expense (D.E. #540).	0.10
04/04/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 4/4/17 9:28 am email with [REDACTED]	0.30 PR
04/04/17	CAA	Receive and review "rough" draft of 3/30/17 hearing transcript received from Pleasonton & Marsaa Court Reporting; profile same into system; prepare and send email to B. O'Connell and J. Foglietta re: same	0.10 PP A D
04/04/17	CCC	Drafted Petition for Instructions regarding the COI received from Eliot (.6); <u>Telephone conference with CA regarding same (.1)</u>	0.70 D .6
04/05/17	BMO	Receipt and review of SRL 4/5/17 1:12 pm email memo [REDACTED]	0.10 PR
04/05/17	BMO	Receipt and review of SRL 4/5/17 1:14 pm email memo [REDACTED]	0.10 PR
04/05/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] calendar same	0.10 D PP A
04/05/17	CAA	Meet and discuss with J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]	0.10 D
04/05/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta to B. O'Connell re: [REDACTED]	0.10 D
04/05/17	JAF	Consideration of Eliot demand for malpractice information.	0.10
04/05/17	JAF	Research re sale [REDACTED]	0.20
04/06/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/6/17 9:24 am email from Pleasonton and Marsaa Court Reporting with attached 3/30/17 Hearing Transcript.	0.80

04/06/17	CAA	Receive and review email from Pleasanton & Marsaa Court Reporting re: hearing transcript for 3/30/17 (PR's Pet for Auth to Pay 2014 Property Taxes); print for B. O'Connell's and J. Foglietta's review	0.20	D PP A
04/06/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: [REDACTED]	0.10	D PP A
04/07/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/7/17 Order Setting Hearing on Motion Eliot Bernstein as Beneficiary of the Estate of Simon Bernstein.	0.10	
04/07/17	BMO	Receipt and review of email from Susan Johnson with attached 4/7/17 Feaman correspondence to Kenneth Pollock.	0.20	
04/07/17	CAA	Receive and review email from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; profile conflict check in system	0.10	D PP A
04/07/17	CAA	Receive and review email instructions from J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; review file re: [REDACTED]; review 15th Circuit court records re: [REDACTED]; prepare and send response email to J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]	0.40	D PP A
04/07/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: 4/3/17 Order Denying E. Bernstein's Motion to Have Videotaped Recordings of All Proceedings Due to Proven and Adnitted Fraud on the Court by Court Appointed Officers and Fiduciaries and More, on the Court's Own Motion and Expense	0.10	D PP A
04/08/17	BMO	Prepare 4/8/17 7:49 pm email to James Stamos with attached Feaman 4/7/17 correspondence to Pollock.	0.10	
04/09/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF email memo.	0.10	PR
04/10/17	CAA	Review PACER for any federal action brought by E. Bernstein against Jerald Beer; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: same	0.40	
04/11/17	BMO	Telephone call to Ken Pollack re: Stansbury claim.	0.40	

04/11/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/11/17 Amended Order Setting Hearing on Motion Eliot I. Bernstein as beneficiary of the Estate of Simon L. Bernstein (Amended as to Time Only).	0.10
04/11/17	JAF	Revisions to petition for instructions re conflict waiver and analysis of persons and entities listed in conflict waiver (.3); Revisions to petition for instructions on foreclosure of forebearance of second mortgage (.2).	0.50
04/11/17	CCC	Revised Petitions for Instruction to Court re: Mortgage and revised Petition for Instructions to Court re: Conflict of Interest Waiver Firm	1.40
04/12/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Order Setting Hearing on Motion of Eliot Bernstein as Beneficiary of the Estate of Simon L. Bernstein on 4/27/17; review file to determine what motion; review court's docket sheet re: same; telephone conference with Judge Scher's judicial assistant re: docket entry referenced in Order Setting is on a Motion previously denied by the Court; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: same	0.50 D P P A
04/13/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/13/17 9:53 am email from Marie Chandler with attached Response to Third Last-Minute Motion for Extension, and Renewed Request for Dismissal and Imposition of Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant.	0.10 P R
04/13/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Appellee's, Ted S. Bernstein, as Trustee, Response to Third Last-Minute Motion to Extension, and Renewed Request for Dismissal and Imposition of Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant, filed 4/13/17 by Alan Rose, 4D16-3314.	0.10

04/13/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Appellant's Motion for Additional Reasonable Extension-Stay-Continuance Based on the Fraud in Proceedings and Related Circumstances, filed 4/12/17 in 4th DCA 4D16-3314 by Eliot Bernstein.	0.20	
04/13/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/13/17 5:23 pm email from Alan Rose to Peter Feaman re: Stansbury case status.	0.10	
04/13/17	CAA	Extended telephone conference with Judge Scher's judicial assistant re: what E. Bernstein matter is being heard at special set hearing on 4/27/17; update Calendar; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: same	0.40	PR A
04/14/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/14/17 1:44 pm email from Ted Bernstein.	0.10	
04/14/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/14/17 1:59 pm email from Alan Rose.	0.10	
04/14/17	BMO	Prepare 4/14/17 2:31 pm email to Ted Bernstein.	0.10	
04/14/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Motion Requesting a Special Set Hearing on Stansbury's Motion to Be Relieved of Responsibility of Funding the Chicago Litigation and Successor Trustee's Motion to Be Ratified as Successor Trustee, filed 4/14/17 by Peter Feaman.	0.10	
04/14/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/14/17 1:14 pm email from Alan Rose re: discussing next steps in general and next steps in settlement.	0.10	
04/17/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/17/17 Order of Recusal by Judge Joseph Marx and Reassignment.	0.10	
04/17/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/17/17 Clerk's Notice of Reassignment.	0.10	
04/17/17	JAF	Considered [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	
04/18/17	BMO	Attend meeting with Ted Bernstein and Alan Rose.	1.10	PR

04/18/17	ANG	Attend meeting with Ted Bernstein and Alan Rose.	1.10
04/19/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/19/17 10:27 am email from Jim Stamos.	0.10
04/19/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/19/17 1:46 pm email from Alan Rose to Peter Feaman re: Clerk's Notice of Reassignment.	0.10
04/19/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/19/17 3:14 pm email from Eileen Rosenquist (Stamos firm), with attached invoice for legal services rendered through 3/31/17.	0.10
04/19/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: invoice from Pleasonton & Marsaa for transcript of hearing held on 3/30/17; arrange for payment of same	0.20 PP A
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/20/17 10:22 am email from Peter Feaman re: Clerk's Notice of Reassignment 502012CA013933.	0.10
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/20/17 10:28 am email from Peter Feaman to Jim Stamos.	0.10
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/20/17 10:52 am email from Trish Roth re: Stansbury, scheduling a Motion Calendar hearing.	0.10 PR
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/20/17 12:43 pm email from Alan Rose re: Stansbury, scheduling a Motion Calendar hearing.	0.10 PR
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/20/17 12:46 pm email from Alan Rose re: Stansbury case.	0.10
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Eliot Bernstein email re: Stansbury, scheduling a Motion Calendar hearing.	0.10 PR
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CBIZ statements dated 4/18/17.	0.10 PR
04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Hearing for 4/27/17, filed 4/20/17 by Peter Feaman, on M/Requesting a Special Set Hearing on Stansbury's M/to Be Relieved of Responsibility of Funding the Chicago Litigation and Successor Trustee's Motion to be Ratified as Successor Trustee.	0.10

04/20/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Notice of Unavailability filed 4/20/17 by Peter Feaman for period of 5/22/17 through and including 5/26/17.	0.10
04/20/17	CAA	Email communications with J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; telephone conference with Melanie Hill, owner of Koffki re: whether or not she is interested per my prior emails and telephone conferences with her; receive voicemail from Melanie; return call re: same; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] update Memo re: [REDACTED]	0.60 PP A D
04/20/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: court's Amended Order Setting Hearing on 4/27/17 re: E. Bernstein's 2/16/17 Motion Under Florida Rules of Civil Procedure 1.540, etc., Motion to Vacate-Amend-Modify in Part Case Mgmt Order of 12/13/16, etc.	0.10 PP A D
04/20/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: E. Bernstein's (Appellant's) 4/12/17 Motion for Additional Reasonable Extension-Stay-Continuance Based on the Fraud in the Proceedings and Related Circumstances, and Appellee, Ted Bernstein's 4/13/17 Response to Third Last-Minute Motion for Extension, and Renewed Request for Dismissal and Imposition of Non-Monetary Sanctions Against Pro Se Appellant, filed in appellate matter 4D16-3314	0.20 PP A D
04/20/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: W. Stansbury's 4/14/17 Motion Requesting a Special Set Hearing on Stansbury's Motion to be Relieved of Responsibility of funding Chicago Litigation and Successor Trustee's Motion to be Ratified as Successor Trustee	0.10 PP A D
04/20/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Stamos & Trucco's 4/19/17 invoice re: Illinois federal action; review all invoices	0.30 PP A D

04/20/17	CAA	Receive, review, profile in system and consider action to be taken re: White Lion invoice for May storage; arrange for payment of same	0.20	PP A D
04/20/17	JAF	Instructions to CA re [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	
04/21/17	JAF	Instructions to CA re [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	
04/22/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/22/17 11:11 pm email from Alan Rose re: Stansbury case.	0.10	
04/24/17	BMO	Prepare 4/24/17 7:22 am instructional email to JAF.	0.10	
04/24/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: Order of Recusal and Reassignment, and Clerk's Notice of Reassignment to Division AO - Judge Rowe for all further proceedings re: Stansbury v. Estate of Simon Bernstein (502012CA013933); update file	0.20	PP A D
04/25/17	CAA	Receive and review emails between A. Rose and P. Feaman re: reassignment of 502012CA013933 (Stansbury v. E/O Simon) case to Judge Rowe and trial not on Judge Rowe's docket and agreement from P. Feaman to do nothing on case pending Order from Judge Scher in Estate matter; prepare and send email to B. O'Connell and J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]; remove all trial entries from calendar	0.90	PP A D
04/25/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: W. Stansbury's 4/20/17 Notice of Hearing for 4/27/17 on his Motion Requesting Special Set Hearing on Stansbury's Motion to be Relieved of Responsibility of Funding the Chicago Litigation and Successor Trustee's Motion to be Ratified as Successor Trustee; receive and review email from E. Bernstein to P. Feaman requesting that he cancel hearing and reschedule; begin prep for 4/27/17 hearing folder	0.70	PP A P

04/25/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: in system, P. Feaman's 4/20/17 Notice of Unavailability on 5/22/17 through and including 5/26/17	<u>0.10</u> PP A D
04/25/17	CAA	Receive, review profile in system and consider action to be taken re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; review file re: [REDACTED]; profile [REDACTED] in system	<u>0.30</u> PP A D
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 4/26/17 2:56 pm email Mrachek and Feaman firms re: 4/27/17 hearing.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/26/17 3:05 pm email from Marie Chandler re: 4/27/17 hearing.	0.10
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 4/26/17 3:04 pm email to Trish Roth re: 4/27/17 hearing.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/26/17 3:08 pm email from Peter Feaman re: 4/27/17 hearing.	0.10
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 4/26/17 3:09 am email memo.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 4/26/17 3:10 am email to Peter Feaman re: 4/27/17 hearing.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/26/17 3:13 pm email from Peter Feaman re: 4/27/17 Hearing.	0.10
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 4/26/17 3:12 pm email to Peter Feaman re: 4/27/17 Hearing.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/26/17 3:15 pm email from Peter Feaman re: 4/27/17 Hearing.	0.10
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 4/26/17 3:14 pm email memo.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of ANC 4/26/17 3:32 pm email to Alan Rose and Ted Bernstein re: Stansbury and mediation.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 4/26/17 4:51 pm email memo.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 4/26/17 4:54 pm email memo.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/26/17 7:55 pm email from Alan Rose re: Stansbury case.	0.10

04/26/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/26/17 11:07 pm email from Alan Rose re: tangible personal property.	0.10
04/26/17	CAA	Prepare hearing folders on Stansbury's Motion Requesting Special Set Hearing on his Motion to be Relieved of Responsibility of Funding the Chicago Litigation, and on E. Bernstein's 2/16/17 Motion Under Florida Rules of Civil Procedure... Motion to Vacate-Amend-Modify in Part Case Mgmt Conf Order of 12/13/16, etc., etc.; prepare proposed Orders; coordinate court reporter; review Westlaw and print cited authority by E. Bernstein; meet with J. Foglietta re: hearing folder	4.50
04/26/17	ANG	Prepare for and attend telephone call with Jim Stamos.	0.60
04/26/17	JAF	Review of revised memo on [REDACTED] (.1); Prepared detailed email to Alan Rose outlining the options for bulk sale of TPP and request for final decision as to kids purchase of property (.1).	0.20
04/26/17	JAF	Instructions to CA re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40
04/26/17	JAF	Analysis of Eliot motion and accusations made therein in preparation for hearing on Eliot motion for amended case management order and orderly hearing.	1.20
04/26/17	JAF	Strategy conference with BMO in preparation for hearing on Eliot motion for amended case management order and orderly hearing.	0.40
04/26/17	JAF	Analysis of 2014 case management order in preparation for filing of petition for instructions re 2nd mortgage and petition for instructions re conflict waiver.	0.20

4.50 1P A U
2.5 UT

04/26/17	ZR	Instructions re: [REDACTED]	0.20
04/27/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA 4/27/17 9:39 am email re: [REDACTED]	0.10 PR
04/27/17	BMO	Strategy conference with JAF re: [REDACTED]	0.50
04/27/17	BMO	Attended Hearing on Eliot Motion to Vacate Case Management Order, for Injunction, Stay, Removal, and Orderly Hearings.	0.80
04/27/17	BMO	Receipt and review of ZR 4/27/17 9:52 am email re: [REDACTED]	0.10 PR
04/27/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 4/27/17 10:15 am email to Alan Rose re: tangible personal property.	0.10 PR
04/27/17	BMO	Receipt and review of CAA email memo with [REDACTED]	0.10 PR
04/27/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/27/17 Order Denying M/Vacate and Denying M/Disqualify for Inappropriate Jurisdiction, Alternatively, Denying on Its Merits, and Order Denying Appointment of Ted Bernstein as AAL.	0.20
04/27/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/27/17 4th DCA Order Per Curiam.	0.10
04/27/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/27/17 4th DCA Order granting in part that Appellant's 4/12/17 Motion for Additional Reasonable Extension-Stay-Continuance based on Newly Discvoered evidence, etc.	0.10
04/27/17	BMO	Prepare for and attend Hearing on Eliot's Motion 1.540.	2.20

04/27/17	CAA	Complete preparation of hearing folder on court's set hearing on Eliot's 2/16/17 Motion to Vacate-Amend-Modify in part 12/13/16 Case Management Order, etc., etc.; review Eliot's exhibits to 2/16/17 Case Management Conference to obtain Wilmington Statement; prepare and send email to J. Foglietta re: [REDACTED]	2.70	5/5/T
04/27/17	ANG	Instructions to JAF re: [REDACTED]	0.20	
04/27/17	ANG	Prepare with BMO for Hearing on Eliot Bernstein's 2/16/17 Motion to Vacate-Amend-Modify in part Case Management Order of 12/13/16, and to Establish Orderly Structure for Evidentiary Hearings, etc.	0.30	
04/27/17	JAF	Consideration of offer on sale of TPP in bulk.	0.10	
04/27/17	JAF	Continued preparation and planning for hearing on Eliot motion for amended case management order and orderly hearing and review of various pleadings mentioned in Eliot motion.	1.70	1.30 D
04/27/17	JAF	Conducted research [REDACTED] in preparation for hearing on Eliot motion to vacate etc.	0.30	
04/27/17	JAF	Finalized research [REDACTED] in preparation for hearing on Eliot motion to vacate, etc.	0.30	
04/27/17	JAF	Conducted research [REDACTED] in preparation for Eliot motion to vacate, etc. hearing.	0.40	
04/27/17	JAF	Strategy conference with BMO re [REDACTED]	0.50	

04/27/17	JAF	Attended hearing on Eliot motion to vacate case management order, for injunction, stay, removal, and orderly hearings (.3, plus .5 NO Charge).	0.30
04/27/17	ZR	Attend Stansbury's hrg. on his M/Requesting a Special Set Hearing on Stansbury's M/to be Relieved of Responsibility of Funding the Chicago Lit and Successor Trustee's M/to be Ratified as Successor Trustee; <u>Travel time</u> .	<u>1.50</u> <u>.5</u> UT
04/27/17	CCC	Researched [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.20
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/28/17 10:41 am email from Trish Roth re: proposed Order Setting Hearing for 6/2/17 at 1:30 pm.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/28/17 10:49 am email from Alan Rose re: proposed Order Setting Hearing for 6/2/17 at 1:30 pm.	0.10
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/28/17 10:54 am email from Trish Roth re: proposed Order Setting Hearing for 6/2/17 @ 1:30 pm.	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/28/17 11:22 am email from Alan Rose re: proposed Order Setting Hearing for 6/2/17 @ 1:30 pm.	0.10
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/28/17 11:39 am email from Peter Feaman re: proposed Order Setting Hearing for 6/2/17 @ 1:30 pm.	0.10
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of JAF 4/28/17 6:05 pm email memo re: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	<u>0.10</u> PR
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of 4/28/17 Order Denying Eliot Bernstein, as a Beneficiary of the Estate of Simon L. Bernstein with Standing and an Interested Person Under Law.	0.10
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Trustee's Motion for Entry of Standing Order Governing Hearings, filed 4/28/17 by Alan Rose in 502012CP004391.	0.10
04/28/17	BMO	Receipt and review of Trustee's Motion for Entry of Standing Order Governing Hearings, filed 4/28/17 by Alan Rose in 502014CP003698.	0.10