

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Statement as of February 28, 2018
Statement No. 35774

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
12/20/2017	RJK	Conferences with Eliot Bernstein regarding parents probate matters.	2.00	300.00	600.00
12/22/2017	RJK	Continued review of relevant documents.	2.00	300.00	600.00
12/27/2017	RJK	Meeting with Eliot Bernstein, Candice Schwager, RJK, Paul Turner and Marc Soss to discuss Estate of Simon Bernstein. Review of relevant documents.	3.00	300.00	900.00
12/27/2017	PDT	Reviewed potential client's documents, conference with RK and originating counsel, and meeting with potential client.	4.50	300.00	1,350.00
01/10/2018	RJK	Review of draft engagement letter and related issues; telephone conferences regarding same.	1.50	300.00	450.00
01/12/2018	PDT	Call with JRD attorney for Bivins.	1.00	300.00	300.00
01/17/2018	RJK	Miscellaneous conference regarding status of the Bernstein matters.	2.00	300.00	600.00
01/23/2018	RJK	Continued review of related documents and time from earlier meetings and telephone conferences.	3.00	450.00	1,350.00
02/01/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Eliot Bernstein and review of relevant documents regarding same.	1.00	300.00	300.00
02/02/2018	JSB	Draft and file Notice of Appearance and Designation of Primary and Secondary Email Addresses; Pull and review docket.	0.40	100.00	40.00
02/02/2018	RJK	Meet with Eliot and Josh Bernstein; telephone conferences with Marc Soss regarding same; review of related documents regarding same.	2.50	300.00	750.00
02/02/2018	CTP	Review and analyze materials provided by A. Bourget (Mrachek).	0.50	200.00	100.00
02/02/2018	PDT	Meeting re emergency filings and hearing.	2.00	300.00	600.00
02/03/2018	RJK	Review of miscellaneous e-mails regarding engagement letter issues.	1.00	300.00	300.00
02/05/2018	JSB	Draft Conflict Waiver Letter; Call with Mark Soss re second action; Pull and review Shirley Bernstein docket; Draft Notice of Appearance for same; Revise and file Objection to Motion to Approve Mediation Settlement.	1.20	100.00	120.00

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

02/05/2018	RJK	Review of motions, docket, review of estate planning documents; conferences regarding same; miscellaneous telephone conferences with Marc Soss; review of Objection and related documents.	4.00	300.00	1,200.00
02/05/2018	CTP	Prepare for hearing on settlement and review background information; attention to notice of appearance; calls with M. Soss.	3.00	200.00	600.00
02/06/2018	RJK	Telephone conferences with Marc Soss. Conference with C. Perre regarding court hearing; review of miscellaneous e-mails regarding same.	1.00	300.00	300.00
02/06/2018	CTP	Travel to, attend, and argue hearing on motion to approve settlement (successful).	3.20	200.00	640.00
02/07/2018	RJK	Telephone conferences with Marc Soss and Eliot Bernstein; review of various e-mails; review of estate planning documents for Mr. and Mrs. Bernstein; review of letters to GAL Diana Lewis; review of related documents; review of insurance trust and related documentation.	6.00	300.00	1,800.00
02/07/2018	CTP	Call with J. Bernstein and E. Bernstein to discuss case strategy, and follow-up discussion with M. Soss regarding same; compile case action items.	2.00	200.00	400.00
02/07/2018	PDT	Call with clients re follow up to 2/6/18 hearing. Discussion with team and clients re go forward plans re Josh re accounting, guardian, and funds.	1.10	300.00	330.00
02/08/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Petition for Authorization to Sell Tangible Personal Property.	0.10	100.00	10.00
02/08/2018	RJK	Review of Eliot's Motion against Oppenheimer Trust and review of related estate planning documents and court documents.	1.50	300.00	450.00
02/09/2018	RJK	Review of file and related pleadings; conferences regarding same; respond to email from Peter Feaman's office.	2.00	300.00	600.00
02/14/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss; and review of pleadings sent by Peter regarding removal of Ted Bernstein as Trustee.	2.00	300.00	600.00
02/14/2018	PDT	Call with Attorney Peter Feaman re closing of insurance business and understanding re scope of premiums and expected amounts and durations of renewals. Also discussed ousting of Ted.	0.40	300.00	120.00
02/15/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Notice Of Hearing on Petition for Authorization to Sell Tangible Personal Property and for Status Conference on Petition for Authorization to Sell Estate Jewelry.	0.10	100.00	10.00
02/16/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss regarding outstanding issues.	0.60	300.00	180.00
02/28/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Notice of Cancellation of March 1, 2018 Hearing and Petition For Attorney's Fees.	0.10	100.00	10.00

Sub-total Fees: \$15,610.00

*Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301*

Expenses

2/28/2018 Administrative Expenses.

Units Price Amount

1.00 624.40 624.40

Sub-total Expenses: \$624.40

Total Current Billing: \$16,234.40

Previous Balance Due: \$0.00

Total Now Due: **\$16,234.40**

*Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301*

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Statement as of March 31, 2018
Statement No. 36053

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
03/05/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order to Show Cause why Eliot Bernstein Should not be Held in Contempt of Court.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/05/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss; conference with Paul Turner regarding status; review of pleadings regarding same.	1.20	300.00	360.00
03/05/2018	RJK	Review of Order to Show cause regarding Eliot Bernstein and conference regarding same.	0.70	300.00	210.00
03/06/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order Specially Setting Hearing.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/06/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Eliot Bernstein and Paul Turner; conference regarding same.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/07/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Verified Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement with William Stansbury.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/07/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss; review of file regarding outstanding issues.	1.30	300.00	390.00
03/08/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Petition for Instructions Re Second Mortgage and Note.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/08/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss and Eliot Bernstein to go over pleadings and strategies and what to do.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/15/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order on Plaintiff's Amended Motion to Continue Trial.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/15/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Notice of Hearing on Verified Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement with William Stansbury.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/15/2018	RJK	Review of pleading and related documents sent by Eliot Bernstein.	1.80	300.00	540.00
03/16/2018	RJK	Review of pleadings and miscellaneous telephone conferences with Marc Soss.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/22/2018	RJK	Review of e-mails and pleadings sent by Eliot Bernstein.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/23/2018	RJK	Send March Soss follow up e-mails regarding drafting petitions and conference regarding same.	0.60	300.00	180.00
03/27/2018	RJK	Miscellaneous conferences regarding upcoming hearing and related issues; conferences regarding same.	1.50	300.00	450.00

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

03/28/2018	RJK	Conferences with Paul Turner; telephone calls with Marc Soss and Eliot Bernstein; review of pleadings and related documents and issues; follow up to see if Bill Stansbury settled with the Estate of Shirley Bernstein.	2.20	300.00	660.00
03/29/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order on Successor PR's Supplement to Petition for Instructions Re Second Mortgage and Note.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/29/2018	RJK	Review of e-mails; pleadings and conferences regarding same.	1.30	300.00	390.00
03/30/2018	RJK	Review of e-mails and conferences regarding same.	0.60	300.00	180.00
			Sub-total Fees:	\$5,230.00	

Expenses

		Units	Price	Amount
3/31/2018	Administrative Expenses.	1.00	209.20	209.20
		Sub-total Expenses:	\$209.20	
			Total Current Billing:	\$5,439.20
			Previous Balance Due:	\$16,234.40
			Total Now Due:	\$21,673.60

*Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301*

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Invoice as of April 30, 2018
Invoice No. 36826

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
04/02/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Notice of Cancellation of Hearing on Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement with William Stansbury.	0.10	100.00	10.00
04/02/2018	JSB	Review Stansbury docket; Pull requested items from same; Draft email to P. Turner re same.	0.60	100.00	60.00
04/02/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Eliot and Josh and review of related documents and pleadings.	2.50	300.00	750.00
04/03/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order Special Setting Hearings on 1). Objection to Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement with Tescher & Spallina; 2). Petition for Authorization to Sell Tangible Personal Prop; and 3). Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement with Stansbury.	0.10	100.00	10.00
04/04/2018	JSB	Pull and review docket; Emails back and forth wit P. Turner re lack of access to requested documents.	0.20	100.00	20.00
04/05/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss regarding status of pleadings.	0.50	300.00	150.00
04/11/2018	RJK	Follow-up email and call to Marc Soss regarding status.	0.50	300.00	150.00
04/12/2018	RJK	Send another follow up email to Marc Soss.	0.30	300.00	90.00
04/18/2018	RJK	Follow up with Marc Soss and Paul Turner.	1.00	300.00	300.00
04/20/2018	JSB	Begin pulling materials for use at 04/27/18 hearing; Pull and review docket.	0.40	100.00	40.00
04/24/2018	MA	Confer with PT regarding Bernstein matter; review initial emails.	1.20	325.00	390.00
04/25/2018	RJK	Conference regarding status.	0.50	300.00	150.00
04/26/2018	MA	Review files and motions in preparation for hearing on pending motions, conference with Robin King and Paul Turner regarding same.	4.30	325.00	1,397.50
04/26/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Miguel regarding Thursday hearing and review of pleadings and attachments.	1.50	300.00	450.00
04/26/2018	MDZ	Prepare documents for hearings on April 27.	0.40	120.00	48.00
04/27/2018	MA	Travel to and attend evidentiary hearing on various motions.	8.50	325.00	2,762.50

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

04/27/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order on Motion to Approve Settlement Agreement with Tescher & Spallina, Order on Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement with William Stansbury, and 3 Orders on Petition for Order Authorizing Payment of Attorneys' Fees.	0.20	100.00	20.00
04/30/2018	RJK	Review of Florida statutes on compelling a PR to prepare an accounting; review of forms regarding same; conference regarding same.	1.00	300.00	300.00
			Sub-total Fees:	\$7,098.00	

Expenses

		Units	Price	Amount
4/30/2018	Administrative Expenses.	1.00	283.92	283.92
		Sub-total Expenses:	\$283.92	
			Total Current Billing:	\$7,381.92
			Previous Balance Due:	\$21,673.60
			Total Now Due:	\$29,055.52

*Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301*

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Invoice as of May 31, 2018
 Invoice No. 37187

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
 2753 NW 34th Street
 Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
05/02/2018	MA	Call with PT re: strategy moving forward.	0.50	325.00	162.50
05/03/2018	RJK	Conference regarding status.	0.40	300.00	120.00
05/07/2018	RJK	Conference regarding status.	0.30	300.00	90.00
05/08/2018	RJK	Leave message for Miguel to go over status.	0.30	300.00	90.00
05/09/2018	MA	Call with Robin King regarding status of action.	0.50	325.00	162.50
05/09/2018	MA	Conference call with Alan Rose regarding status of action and Josh's distributions.	0.70	325.00	227.50
05/09/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Miguel A. and review of miscellaneous e-mails to send to Miguel regarding relevant issue.	0.80	300.00	240.00
05/10/2018	RJK	Follow up with Marc Soss regarding documents.	0.50	300.00	150.00
05/11/2018	MA	Confer with P. Turner regarding value of estate of Bernstein and claims.	0.40	325.00	130.00
05/14/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Second Amended Motion to Re-Close Estate and Discharge Successor PR.	0.10	100.00	10.00
05/21/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Notice of Hearing of Second Renewed Petition to Re-Close Estate.	0.10	100.00	10.00
05/22/2018	RJK	Conference regarding status.	0.50	300.00	150.00
05/30/2018	MA	Telephone conference regarding status of action and strategy moving forward.	0.70	325.00	227.50
05/30/2018	RJK	Review of outstanding issues and telephone conference regarding same.	1.50	300.00	450.00
05/30/2018	PDT	Preparation for call with EB re multiple open matters and call with MA re discovery re Simon's company and possible transfer issues with TB.	1.20	300.00	360.00
05/31/2018	RJK	Review of answer and affirmative defenses filed by Brian O'Connell, Esq; conference regarding same.	1.20	300.00	360.00
Sub-total Fees:					\$2,940.00

Expenses	Units	Price	Amount
5/31/2018 Administrative Expenses.	1.00	117.60	117.60
Sub-total Expenses:			\$117.60

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Total Current Billing:	\$3,057.60
Previous Balance Due:	\$29,055.52
Total Now Due:	\$32,113.12

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Invoice as of June 30, 2018
Invoice No. 37681

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
06/01/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order on Successor PR's Second Renewed Petition to Re-Close Estate and for Discharge.	0.10	100.00	10.00
06/01/2018	RJK	Review of Judge Scher Order Closing Estate and conference regarding same.	1.00	300.00	300.00
06/12/2018	MA	Conference with P Turner and R King regarding trust matter.	0.50	300.00	150.00
06/12/2018	RJK	Conference with Paul Turner and Miguel A. regarding status.	0.50	300.00	150.00
06/18/2018	MDZ	Case overview with Mr. Armenteros and Ms. Rodriguez.	0.20	100.00	20.00
06/19/2018	JSB	Draft and file Notice of Appearance and Designation of Primary and Secondary Email Addresses for Miguel Armenteros.	0.30	100.00	30.00
06/19/2018	JSB	SHIRLEY Notice of Appearance and Designation of Primary and Secondary Email Addresses for Miguel Armenteros.	0.20	100.00	20.00
06/19/2018	RJK	Conference regarding status.	0.30	300.00	90.00
06/19/2018	MDZ	Review and docket Notice of Appearance.	0.10	100.00	10.00
06/26/2018	MDZ	Review file in preparation of hearing on Trustee's Motion to Strike Notice of Appeal.	0.30	100.00	30.00
Sub-total Fees:					\$810.00

Expenses			Units	Price	Amount
6/30/2018	Administrative Expenses.		1.00	32.40	32.40
Sub-total Expenses:					\$32.40
			Total Current Billing:		
					\$842.40
			Previous Balance Due:		
					\$32,113.12
			Total Now Due:		
					\$32,955.52

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Invoice as of July 31, 2018
Invoice No. 37970

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
7/6/2018	LRB	Meeting with Miguel Armenteros to discuss case strategy.	0.30	275.00	82.50
7/6/2018	MDZ	Case review with attorneys.	0.30	120.00	36.00
7/17/2018	MA	Confer with L. Rodriguez regarding discovery moving forward.	0.50	325.00	162.50
7/17/2018	LRB	Meeting with Miguel Armenteros to discuss case strategy.	0.50	275.00	137.50
7/17/2018	MDZ	Preparation for and attendance at case meeting with attorneys.	1.00	120.00	120.00
7/24/2018	LRB	Review of case, previous filings against the estate, and William Stansbury's settlement. Meeting with Miguel to discuss companies against whom Stansbury brought his claims. Preparation of subpoena duces tecum to William Stansbury.	2.70	275.00	742.50
7/24/2018	MDZ	Review and docket Order to Show Cause and Re-Setting Hearing.	0.20	100.00	20.00
7/25/2018	LRB	Review of Stansbury Complaint.	1.00	275.00	275.00
7/25/2018	LRB	Preparation of discovery.	3.30	275.00	907.50
7/26/2018	LRB	Preparation of Subpoena Duces Tecum for Deposition to Ted Bernstein.	2.80	275.00	770.00
7/26/2018	MDZ	Confer with Ms. Bordner.	0.20	100.00	20.00
7/31/2018	LRB	Receipt and review of email regarding status of court registry funds.	0.10	275.00	27.50

Sub-total Fees: \$3,301.00

10% Courtesy Discount: (330.10)

Total Current Billing: \$2,970.90

Previous Balance Due: \$32,955.52

Total Now Due: **\$35,926.42**

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Invoice as of August 31, 2018
Invoice No. 38504

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
8/6/2018	MDZ	Review and docket Notice of Compliance as to deposit into Court Registry.	0.10	100.00	10.00
8/7/2018	MA	Various communications regarding deposit to clerk; review trustee's notice of compliance; review and revise subpoenas for deposition to Stansbury and T. Bernstein.	1.90	300.00	570.00
8/7/2018	LRB	Followed up on case and review of Trustee's Notice of Compliance related to distributions ordered for Eliot's children.	0.20	275.00	55.00
8/7/2018	MDZ	Review Judge's procedures in preparation of motion to appear telephonically at hearing on motion to consolidate and proposed order.	0.80	100.00	80.00
8/14/2018	MA	Conference with Bill Stansbury regarding claims.	1.00	300.00	300.00
8/15/2018	MA	Confer with P. Turner re: strategy moving forward.	0.40	300.00	120.00
8/23/2018	LRB	Receipt of and review of order to show cause.	0.10	275.00	27.50
8/30/2018	MA	Confer with Paul Turner regarding motion to disburse funds; review trust agreement for Simon Bernstein.	0.40	300.00	120.00
8/30/2018	MA	Confer with L. Rodriguez regarding motion to disburse funds; review probate forms; revise and finalize same.,.	0.60	300.00	180.00
8/30/2018	LRB	Meeting with Miguel Armenteros to discuss Motion to dispense funds for Josh Bernstein. Review of Ted Bernstein's Notice of Compliance with order directing deposit of funds into court registry for benefit of Eliot Bernstein children. Research into court registry deposit amounts for benefit of Josh Bernstein. Meeting with Miguel Armenteros to identify deposits. Preparation of Motion to Disburse Funds.	1.30	275.00	357.50
8/30/2018	MDZ	Review Court Registry and case docket entries to determine funds deposited for benefit of Joshua Bernstein.	0.50	100.00	50.00
8/30/2018	MDZ	Meeting with attorneys regarding court registry deposits and distribution motion.	0.30	100.00	30.00
8/31/2018	MA	Review trust of Simon Bernstein.	0.40	300.00	120.00

Sub-total Fees: \$2,020.00

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Total Current Billing:	\$2,020.00
Previous Balance Due:	\$35,926.42
Total Now Due:	\$37,946.42

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Balance Statement

Tuesday, August 14, 2018

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

The amount listed below is currently outstanding. Please remit payment as soon as possible.

Matter ID	Date	Inv. No.	Amount	Paid	Balance
F-3580-001	03/27/2018	35774	16,234.40	0.00	16,234.40
F-3580-001	04/12/2018	36053	5,439.20	0.00	5,439.20
F-3580-001	05/24/2018	36826	7,381.92	0.00	7,381.92
F-3580-001	06/18/2018	37187	3,057.60	0.00	3,057.60
F-3580-001	07/20/2018	37681	842.40	0.00	842.40
F-3580-001	08/14/2018	37970	2,970.90	0.00	2,970.90
Total Now Due:			\$35,926.42	\$0.00	\$35,926.42

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Balance Statement

Thursday, September 20, 2018

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

The amount listed below is currently outstanding. Please remit payment as soon as possible.

Matter ID	Date	Inv. No.	Amount	Paid	Balance
F-3580-001	03/27/2018	35774	16,234.40	0.00	16,234.40
F-3580-001	04/12/2018	36053	5,439.20	0.00	5,439.20
F-3580-001	05/24/2018	36826	7,381.92	0.00	7,381.92
F-3580-001	06/18/2018	37187	3,057.60	0.00	3,057.60
F-3580-001	07/20/2018	37681	842.40	0.00	842.40
F-3580-001	08/14/2018	37970	2,970.90	0.00	2,970.90
F-3580-001	09/19/2018	38504	2,020.00	0.00	2,020.00
Total Now Due:			\$37,946.42	\$0.00	\$37,946.42

PBYA

200 SOUTH ANDREWS AVENUE, SUITE 600
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33301
T: 954.566.7117
F: 954.566.7115

283 CATALONIA AVENUE, SUITE 200
CORAL GABLES, FL 33134
T: 305.377.0086
F: 305.377.0781

WWW.PBYALAW.COM

MARK A. ALBRIGHT
MIGUEL ARMENTEROS
RICARDO BAJANDAS
W. JOE BUCCERO
RICHARD DECICCA
D. PORPOISE EVANS
JONATHAN FELDMAN
LUIS FERNANDEZ DE LA VARA
ARIELLA GUTMAN
ROBIN KING
ERIC KUPER
JOEY LAMPERT
LINDSEY B. MANDLER
JASON E. PERLMAN
BENJAMIN REISS
LILIAN RODRIGUEZ-BAZ
PAUL D. TURNER
EDWARD T. YEVOLI
JENNIFER YEVOLI

OPTIONS FOR PAYING PBYA FEES (INVOICES)

Wire Transfer

Wire to: **City National Bank of Florida**
ABA Number: **066004367**
Account Name: **Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright, P.L. Operating Account**
Account Number: **1955120139**
Swift Code: **CNBFUS3M**

Check or Money Order Mailed to:

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright, P.L.
200 South Andrews Avenue, Suite 600
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33301

Credit Card (Visa, MasterCard or American Express)

Complete form below and fax to 954-566-7115.

Name: _____

Address: street _____

city _____ state _____ zip _____

Credit Card Number: _____

Expiration Date: _____ Amount: _____



CVV2 : _____ al) What is CVV2?

The CVV2 value is a 3-digit number printed at the end of the credit card number on the signature panel on the back of the MASTERCARD or VISA. It is the *Non-Embossed* 4-digit # on the front of the AMERICAN EXPRESS.

Authorized Signature: X _____ Date: _____