

STANSBURY LAWSUIT BILLING ENTRIES CIKLIN

1. 07/11/14 BMO Telephone conference with Peter Feaman 0.30 concerning case background, hearing.
2. 07/15/14 JAF Conference with Ben Brown and SHM re: 1.20 transition for curator to PR, outstanding issues and claims, litigation, issues with jewelry, IRA liquidation, valuation of LIC, etc. (.7); Consideration of issues re: same (.3); Post-meeting conference with SHM re: same (.6 no charge); Conference with BMO re: outstanding claim against estate (.1); Revisions to letter to all counsel and parties (.1).
3. 07/18/14 BMO Receipt and review of 7/18/14 0.50 e-correspondence from Eliot Bernstein with background information and detail of his key issues.
4. 07/25/14 BMO Receipt and review of Feaman 7/25/14 0.20 written settlement demand.
5. 07/29/14 BMO Receipt and review of Feaman 7/29/14 0.30 Petition to Remove Ted Bernstein as Successor Trustee of the Simon Bernstein Rev. Trust.
6. 07/29/14 BMO Conference with ANC re: settlement 0.50 proposal.
7. 07/29/14 BMO Conference with Alan Rose and JAF re: 0.60 outstanding issues in estate.
8. 07/29/14 ANG Conference with BMO re: settlement 0.50 proposal.
9. 07/29/14 JAF Conference with Alan Rose and BMO re: 0.80 outstanding issues in estate (.6); Addressed issues re: objection to accounting (.2); Instructions to SHM re: same (.2 no charge).
10. 08/11/14 BMO Strategy conference with JAF and ANC re: 0.40 mediation for Stansbury litigation, litigation re: life insurance of decedent, etc.
11. 08/11/14 BMO Analyze with ANC claimant's offer to settle. 0.40
12. 08/11/14 ANG Strategy conference with BMO and JAF re: 0.40 mediation for Stansbury litigation, litigation re: life insurance of decedent, etc.
13. 08/11/14 JAF Addressed issues re: hearing on motion to 1.50 hold Elliot Bernstein in contempt (.1); Strategy conference with BMO and ANC re:
14. mediation for Stansbury litigation, litigation re: life insurance of decedent, etc. (.4); Consideration of issues re: Illinois litigation and Stansbury claim (.3); Instructions to SHM re: same and mediation (.1 no charge); Review of Tescher and Spallina accenting and began drafting objections to same (.7); Conference with BMO re: same (.2 no charge).
15. 08/19/14 JAF Consideration of issues re: hearing on 0.50 objection to T&S accounting and mediation on Stansbury claim (.3); consideration of issues re: emergency motion for interim distributions (.1); Instructions to SHM re: hearing on removal of Ted as successor trustee (.1).

- 16.10/03/14 BMO Conference with Alan Rose and JAF re: 2.50 outstanding issues in Stansbury litigation, Illinois litigation, Shirley trust and estate, Simon trust and estate, etc.; post-meeting strategy conference with JAF re: same.
- 17.10/03/14 BMO Receipt and review of Amended Complaint 0.40 filed 10/3/14 by Alan Rose.
- 18.10/03/14 JAF Instructions to BL re: IRA and other accounts 3.10 (.1, plus .1 NO Charge); Instructions to SHM re: hearing on objections to T&S accounting (.1- NO Charge); Analysis of issues re: personal property (.5); Conference with Alan Rose and BMO re: outstanding issues in Stansbury litigation, Illinois litigation, Shirley trust and estate, Simon trust and estate, etc.; post-meeting strategy conference with BMO re: same (2.5);
- 19.10/06/14 JAF Addressed issues re: amended complaint 0.10 filed by Ted.
- 20.10/09/14 BMO Receipt and review of BCL 10/9/14 0.10 e-correspondence to John Cappeller, Jr.
- 21.10/10/14 JAF Consideration of issues re: foreclosing of 1st 0.40 mortgage. 10/16/14 CCL Correspond with JF re: mortgage information 0.60 and issues relative to Bernstein Family Realty LLC and decedent's property; review files
- 22.10/16/14 CCL Instructions from JF; confer with SHM; 0.30 review materials for coordinating mediation on Stansbury issues
- 23.12/10/14 BMO Telephone call with Peter Feaman re: settlement 0.20.
- 24.12/12/14 BMO Conference with JAF re: Stansbury settlement 0.10.
- 25.12/12/14 BMO Telephone call from Peter Feaman re: settlement status 0.30.
- 26.12/12/14 JAF Conference with BMO re: Stansbury settlement 0.10.
- 27.12/17/14 JAF Addressed issues re: settlement with Stansbury 0.20.
- 28.12/22/14 BMO Strategy conference with JAF re: preparation 0.30 for status conference, revisions to Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement, Revisions to Motion to Intervene.
- 29.12/23/14 BMO Prepare for and attend hearing on Proposed 1.50 Filing of Successor PR's Motion for Authorization to Enter and Approval of Settlement Agreement.
- 30.12/23/14 BMO Conference with JAF re: Petition for 0.10 Authorization of Settlement Agreement.
- 31.12/24/14 CCL Review settlement agreement Stansbury 0.60 /Ted Bernstein Settlement Agreement; Instructions from JF; finalize, efile, eserve and US Mail Serve Motion for Authority to enter into and Approval of Settlement Agreement
- 32.01/06/15 Review correspondence from Feaman and from Rose; Receive, review and categorize documents 0.30
- 33.01/12/15 BMO Review of Feaman Settlement Agreement with ANC to compare and contrast with the SA attached to Motion to Approve. 0.20
- 34.01/12/15 BMO Receipt and review of 1/12/15 correspondence from Peter Feaman with attached proposed Settlement Agreement signed by Mr. Stansbury 0.10.
- 35.01/12/15 ANG Review of Feaman Settlement A 0.20 with BMO

36.01/26/15 JAF Prep for settlement hearing and statement of 2.10 claim hearing (1.7); Instructions to SHM re: .2 ; Conference with ANC re: - .1); Addressed issues re: JP Morgan account information (.1).

37.01/30/15 BMO Telephone call with Peter Feaman re: 0.30 settlement.

38.01/30/15 BMO Prepare for and attend settlement 4.30 conference.

39.01/20/15 BMO Receipt and review of 1/20/15 email from Maryanne Kaskey with attached Settlement Agreement signed by Feaman and Stansbury. 0.10

40.01/20/15 BMO Receipt and review of 1/20/15 email communications (8), Eliot Bernstein, Alan Rose, Court Reporter, JAF, SHM. 0.20

41.01/26/15 BMO Receipt and review of 1/26/15 letter by Feaman to Judge Colin with attached Memorandum of William Stansbury in Support of P.R. 's Motion to Enter into Settlement Agreement. 0.30

42.02/23/15 JAF Addressed issues re: 2.20 02/23/15 JAF (.9); Conference with BMO re: Multiple revisions to motion for extension of time to response to RTP of Elliot and mot for instructions, etc. (.5); Revisions to letter to beneficiaries re: settlement with Stansbury and payoff of 1st mortgage (.4); Prepared email to Alan Rose re: request for contribution from Trust (.1).

43.02/23/15 JAF Conference with Alan Rose re: request for 0.60 contribution and default interest (.1); Conference with BMO re:-(.2); Revisions to letter to beneficiaries (.3).

44.02/25/15 BMO 0.50 Strategy Conference with JAF re (.3); conference with Peter Feaman and JAF re: (.2).

45.03/04/15 Addressed issues re JAF 1.80 (.5); Reviewed orders on approval of settlement and order on payoff of mortgage, revisions to same; instructions to SHM re (.8); Conference with Peter Feaman re: IRA issues (.2); Consideration of issues re: -(.3).

46.03/05/15 JAF Revisions to letter to Rose re: information on assets and liabilities of simon trust. 0.10

47.03/10/15 BMO Conference with JAF and Elliot and Candice Bernstein re: various issues of Simon Trust, settlement with Stansbury, Illinois litigation, payoff of mortgage with Sahm, etc. (2.0); Post-meeting strategy conference with JAF re: (.2). 2.20 hours

48.03/10/15 BMO Telephone call to Peter Feaman re: trust issues. 0.20

49.03/10/15 JAF Reviewed various issues raised by Elliot in preparation for meeting . 7 ; Addressed issues re: (.2); Conference with BMO and Elliot and Candice Bernstein re: various issues of Simon Trust, settlement with Stansbury, Illinois litigation, payoff of mortgage with Sahm, etc. (2.0); Post-meeting strategy conference with BMO re: (.2). 3.10 hours

50.03/10/15 JAF 1.00 (.9); Prepared email to Eliot re: settlement agreement (.1). 1.00 hours

51.03/13/15 BMO Receipt and review of 3/13/15 0.10 e-correspondence from Capeller with revised Payoff Letter attached. 0.10 hours

52.03/19/15 BMO Receipt and review of Feaman 3/19/15 letter 0.10 to BMO with proposed changes to Settlement Agreement. .10 hrs

- 53.03/31/15 BMO 0.20 350.00 \$70.00 Call to Peter Feaman re: settlement with Stansbury.
- 54.03/31/15 BMO 0.10 350.00 \$35.00 Receipt and review of Rose 3/31/15 e-correspondence to LJ Peter Feaman re: Stansbury claim.
- 55.04/01/15 BMO 0.10 350.00 \$35.00 Receipt and review of 3/26/15 e-correspondence from Rose re: Sahm Mortgage.
- 56.