

Perlman, Bajandas, Yevoli & Albright P.L.

Statement as of March 31, 2018
Statement No. 36053

Eliot Bernstein and Joshua Bernstein
2753 NW 34th Street
Boca Raton, FL 33434

F-3580-001: Estate of Simon Bernstein

Professional Fees			Hours	Rate	Amount
03/05/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order to Show Cause why Eliot Bernstein Should not be Held in Contempt of Court.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/05/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss; conference with Paul Turner regarding status; review of pleadings regarding same.	1.20	300.00	360.00
03/05/2018	RJK	Review of Order to Show cause regarding Eliot Bernstein and conference regarding same.	0.70	300.00	210.00
03/06/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order Specially Setting Hearing.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/06/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Eliot Bernstein and Paul Turner; conference regarding same.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/07/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Verified Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement with William Stansbury.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/07/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss; review of file regarding outstanding issues.	1.30	300.00	390.00
03/08/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Petition for Instructions Re Second Mortgage and Note.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/08/2018	RJK	Telephone conference with Marc Soss and Eliot Bernstein to go over pleadings and strategies and what to do.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/15/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order on Plaintiff's Amended Motion to Continue Trial.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/15/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Notice of Hearing on Verified Motion for Approval of Settlement Agreement with William Stansbury.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/15/2018	RJK	Review of pleading and related documents sent by Eliot Bernstein.	1.80	300.00	540.00
03/16/2018	RJK	Review of pleadings and miscellaneous telephone conferences with Marc Soss.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/22/2018	RJK	Review of e-mails and pleadings sent by Eliot Bernstein.	1.50	300.00	450.00
03/23/2018	RJK	Send March Soss follow up e-mails regarding drafting petitions and conference regarding same.	0.60	300.00	180.00
03/27/2018	RJK	Miscellaneous conferences regarding upcoming hearing and related issues; conferences regarding same.	1.50	300.00	450.00

Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

03/28/2018	RJK	Conferences with Paul Turner; telephone calls with Marc Soss and Eliot Bernstein; review of pleadings and related documents and issues; follow up to see if Bill Stansbury settled with the Estate of Shirley Bernstein.	2.20	300.00	660.00
03/29/2018	JSB	Receipt and review of Order on Successor PR's Supplement to Petition for Instructions Re Second Mortgage and Note.	0.10	100.00	10.00
03/29/2018	RJK	Review of e-mails; pleadings and conferences regarding same.	1.30	300.00	390.00
03/30/2018	RJK	Review of e-mails and conferences regarding same.	0.60	300.00	180.00
			Sub-total Fees:	\$5,230.00	

Expenses

		Units	Price	Amount
3/31/2018	Administrative Expenses.	1.00	209.20	209.20
		Sub-total Expenses:	\$209.20	
			Total Current Billing:	\$5,439.20
			Previous Balance Due:	\$16,234.40
			Total Now Due:	\$21,673.60

*Please remit payment to:
200 S. Andrews Ave, Suite 600, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301*